VILLAGE OF GURNEE

2012~ ¢

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, AS
MODIFIED AND WITH SUPPLEMENTS, PROVIDING PENALITIES FOR VIOLATIONS AND
AMENDING CHAPTER 18 ARTICLE Ill OF THE GURNEE MUNICIPAL CODE

KRISTINA KOVARIK

ANDY HARRIS

BRYAN WINTER

ADOPTED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF TRUSTEES

OF THE

VILLAGE OF GURNEE, ILLINOIS

ON

APRIL 16, 2012

Published in pamphlet form by authority of the Village Board
of the Village of Gurnee, Lake County, lllinois.
this 17t day of April, 2012

President

Clerk

Attorney

JEANNE E. BALMES
GREG GARNER
KiRK MORRIS
STEPHEN PARK
CHERYL G. ROSS
HANK SCHWARZ

Trustee
Trustee
Trustee
Trustee
Trustee

Trustee




2012- 3¢

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE, AS MODIFIED AND WITH SUPPLEMENTS, PROVIDING
PENALITIES FOR VIOLATIONS AND AMENDING CHAPTER 18 ARTICLE Iil OF THE GURNEE MUNICIPAL CODE

WHEREAS The President and Board of Truslees of the Village of Gumee have determined thal ilis in he best
interesl of he Village of Gurnee to amend the Gurnee Building Code (Chapter 18 Article 11l of the Gurnee Municipal Code) and
adopt the 2012 Edition of the Inlernalional Bullding Code as modified. as the standard for regulaling and governing the
conditions and maintenance of all properly, buildings and structures: by providing the standard for supplied ulilities and facilities
! and other physical things and conditions essential (o ensure that slruclures are safe. sanilary and fit for occupation and use
! and the condemnation of bullding and slructures unfil for human occupancy and use and the demolilion of such slructures as
' herein provided. providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees thereol: and each and all of the regulations.

provisions. penallies of the Building Code wilhin the Village of Gurnee.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF
GURNEE, LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS, IN THE EXERCISE OF ITS HOME RULE POWERS, AS FOLLOWS.

|

| SECTION 1. That Chapler 18 Article Ill. entitled Building Code™ of the Gurnee Municipal Code is hereby deleted in iis
| entirety and replaced with a new Chapter 18 Arlicle IIl. enlilled *Building Code". lo provide as follows.
|
|

; “CHAPTER 18 ARTICLE IIl. BUILDING CODE.

: Sec. 18-71. Adoption.

| The regulatens condilions deflinilions. and stipulations concerning the construction, alteration, addition repair, removal i
. demolition use jccalion occupancy. and mainlenance of buildings and structures and their service equipment. as set forth in
i the 2012 International Bullding Code. with modificalions and supplements sel forth in seclion 18-72, are hereby adopted and
, made applicabie subject lo exceplions made in lhis article, to all existing or proposed buildings and accessory struclures, olher
i than those identified in Arlicle VI of this chapler, within the corporate limils of the village. The following chapters, and each 1
i section and subseclion of each such chapter. are not hereby adopted and shall nol be applicable in the village. ‘
Chapter 9 Fire Proteclion Syslems

, Chapter 11 Accessibility |
Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency ‘
w Chapter 27 Electrical

l Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems

| Chapter 34 Existing Structures

| Appendix A Employee Qualfficalions

i Appendix B Board of Appeals

| Appendix C Agricultural Buildings

i Appendix E Supplemenlary Accessibility Requirements
i Appendix H Signs

I Appendix | Palio Covers

i Appendix J Grading

Appendix K Adminislrative Provisions |
l Appendix L Earthquake Recording Instrumentalion |
i Appendix M Tsunami-Generated Flood Hazard I




Sec. 18-102. Modifications, supplements and exceptions.
The following sections and sub-sections of the 2012 International Building Code, are revised as follows
SECTION 101 GENERAL

Section 101.1 Title.

This Sub-Section 1s deleled in its entrely and a new Sub-Section is added to read as follows “These regulaticns shall be
known as lhe Bulding Code of the Village of Gurnee. and shell be cited as such and will be referred lo as this code

Section 101.2 Scope.

Delete the reference lo “International Residential Code” in Exceplion and amend it lo read as follows Residential Dwelling
Code for One and Two Families of the Village of Gurnee

Section 101.2.1 Appendices
This Sub-Section is deleled in ils enlrety and a new Sub-Seclion 1s added to read as follows "Provisions in appendices
chaplers D F G. are adopted in their entirety ~

§ Section 101.4 Referenced Codes.

Section 101.4.1 Gas. Amend this Sub-Section by replacing "IGC electncal-Cade wilh "Gurnee Fuel
| Gasl Code.
| Secticn 101.4.2 Mechanical Amend Sub-Seclion by replacing “Inlemalicnal-Mechanical-Gede” with "Gurnee
Mechanical Code.”
Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. Amend Sub-Seclion by replacing "inernational-Plumbing-Code” wilh "Gurnee
Plumbing Code.”
h Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance, Amend Sub-Section by replacing “Irterrational Property Maintenance-Cede’
t with “Gurnee Property Maintenance Code.”
i
I
| Section 101.4.5 Fire prevention. Amend Sub-Section by replacing “lnlesnatienal-Fire Code” with "Gurnee Fire
| Code
‘. Section 101.4.6 Energy. Amend Sub-Seclion dy replacing “lalernational Energy-Gede™ wilh “lilinois

Energy Code.”
i SECTION 105 PERMITS

Section 105.1.1 through Section 105.1.2
Delete these Sub-Seclions in their entirety without substitution

I Section 105.7 Placement of Permit.
This Sub-Section 1s deleled in ils enlirety and a new Sub-Section 1s added o read as follows.

‘Permit Placard  The permil holder or his agent shall post (he Permit Placard on the jobsite in an accessible and conspicuous
place to allow the building official or fus designee to make required entries. The card shall be maintained on the site unlil the
final Inspection(s) have been completed and approved. A Permit Placard is “site and project specific” and shall only be posted
at the localion where the vork has been authonized and a permil has been issued




SECTION 111 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY

Section 111.4 Revocation
At the end of this Sub-Section a new Sub-Section shall be added to read as lollows

“Section 111.5 Responsibility to secure Certificate of Occupancy
It shall be the responsibility of the building owner or the owner's agent or company authorized by the owner (o enler into
leasing agreements. 1o secure a Cerlificate of Occupancy on behalf to (he accupani(s) of therr building

SECTION 116 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT

Al the end of this Chapler he following Chapter shall be added. SECTION 117 SITE ADDRESS

“Approved numbers or addresses shall be provided for all new buildings and installed on the building in such a position as 1o be
planly visibie and legible frem (he street or road fronling the property ™

CHAPTER 3. USE AND CCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATIONS

SECTION 305 EDUCATIONAL GRQUP

Section 303.1 Educational Group E.

This Sub-Sectlion is deleted in its entirety and a new Sub-Section is added to read as lollows:
Educational Group E occupancy includes. among others. the use of a building or slruclure or a porlion lhereof by
mne or more persons at eny one ime for educational purposes through the 12th grade.

Section 305.2 Group E, day care facilities,

This Sub-Section 1s deleted in ils entirely and a new Sub-Section is added to read as follows
Trus group Includes buildings and structures or porlions (hereof occupied by mare than eighl children older than 2 %
years of age who receive educational, supervision, or personal care services for fewer (han 24 hours per day

Section 305.2.2 Five or Fewer Children.
This Sub-Seclion is deleted in its entirety and a new Sub-Seclion 1s added to read as follows:

Section 305.2.2 Eight or Fewer Children. A facility having eighl or fewer children receiving such day care shall be classified
as part of the primary occupancy.

Section 305.2.3 Five or Fewer Children in a dwelling unit

This Sub-Section is deleled in ils enlirely and a new Sub-Section 12 added lo read as follows.

Section 305.2.3 Eight or Fewer Children in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unil and having
eight or fewer children receiving such day care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the
Residential Dwelling Code for One and Two Families of the Village of Gurnee

SECTION 308 INSTITUTIONAL GROUP

Section 308.6 Group |-4, day care facilities.

This Sub-Section is deleted in ils entirely and a new Sub-Section is added lo read as lollows'

This group shall include buildings and slructures accupied by more than eight persons of any age who receive custodial care for
fewer than 24 hours per day by persons cther than parents or guardians. relalives by blood. marriage or adoplion, and in a
place alher than the home of the person cared for. This group shall include. but not be limiled to, he following

Adult day care

Child day care




Section 308.6.1 Classification as Group E

This Sub-3ection is deleted In its entirely and a new Sub-Seclion 15 added to read as follows

A child day care facility that provides care for more than eighl but no more than 100 children 2 % years or less of age. where the
rooms in which children are cared for are located on a level of exit discharge serving such rooms and each of these child care
rooms has an exil door directly lo the exterior, shall be classified as Group E

Section 308.6.3 Five or fewer persons receiving care

This Sub-Seclion is deleted in its enlirely and a new Sub-Seclion 15 added lo read as follows

Section 308.6.3 Eight or fewer persons receiving care

A facilily having eight or fewer persens receiving custodial care shall be classified as parl of lhe primary occupancy

Section 308.6.4 Five or fewer persons receiving care in a dwelling unit

This Sub-Section is deleted in ils enlirety and a new Sub-Seclion 15 added to read as follows

Section 308.6.4 Eight or fewer persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such as (he above within 2 dwelling unit
and having eight or fewer persons receiving cuslodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with
the Residential Dwelling Code for One and Two Families of the Village of Gurnee

Section 310.5 Residential Group R-3,

7 ius Sub-Section is deleled in its entirety and a new Sub-Seclion 1s added to read as follows

Residenlial occupancies where the occupanls are primarily permanenl in nalure and nol classified as R-1, R-2. R-4_ or |
I cluding

Eulldings thal do nol contain more than two dwelling unils

Eoarding Houses (non-transienl) with 16 or fewer occupants

Boarding Houses (lransient) with 10 or fewer occupanls

Care facililies that provide accommodalions for eight or fewer persons receiving care

Congregate living facilities (non-transient) with 16 or fewer occupants

Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants

Section 310.5.1 Care facilities within a dwelling

This Sub-Seclion is deleled in its entirely and a new Sub-Seclion is added lo read as follows

Care facilities for eighl or fewer persons receiving care lhat are within a single family dwelling are permitled lo comply with the
Residential Dwelling Code for One and Two Families of the Village of Gurnee provided an aulomatic sprinkler syslem is
inslalled in accordance with Seclion 903.3.1.3 or with Seclion P2904 of the Residential Dwelling Code for One and Two
Families of the Village of Gurnee

CHAPTER 13: ENERGY EFFICIENCY

Section 1301.1.1 Criteria
All reference to lhe “Interaational-Energy-Gode” shall be replaced with 'Illinois Energy Efficiency Code.

CHAPTER 28: MECHANICAL SYSTEMS

Section 2801 General
Amend (his Seclion by deleling reference to the “triernational- Meshanical-Gede and replacing this reference with "Gurnee

Mechanica! Code’ and by deleting relerence lo lhe “lnlarnalionak-FuelGas Code” and replacing this relerence with the
Gurnee Fuel Gas Code "



CHAPTER 30: ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS

Section 3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher,

This Sub-Section 15 deleted in its entirely and a new Sub-Seclion 1s added to read as follows:

In buildings requining an elevator. al least one elevator shall be provided for the fire department emergency access o all floors
Such elevator car shell be @ minimum of 80 wide by 517 deep with a minimum capacily of 2500 pounds Said car shall he
equipped wilh a minimum 42" side slide door. Said elevalor shall be labeled by the inlernational symbol for emergency medical
services (star of hfe). The symbol shall not be less than 3 inches high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the hoisl-way

door frame
CHAPTER 35: REFERENCED STANDARDS

ASCE American Society of Civil Engineers
The following standard shall be included.
(ASCE 21-05). Part 1. 2008
Automaled People Mover Standards
[ANSIVASCE/T&DI 21 2-08) Parts 2. 3 and 4. 2008
Aulemaled People Mover Standards

ASME American Society of Mechanical Engineers
The following standards shall be included as follows:
(ASME A 17 7-2007/CSA B44.7-07)

Performance Based Safety Code for Efevalors and Escalalors
(ASME A17 2-2004)

Guide lor Inspection of Elevators, Escalators, and Moving Walks

(ASKE A17.3-2005)

Safety Code for Existing Elevalors and Escalators
(ASME QEI-1-2007)

Standard for the Qualification of Elevalor Inspectors

* With respect to ASME A17.3-2005, only upgrades required by applicalion of the Safety Code for Existing Elevalors and

Escalators must be compleled no later than January 1. 2015 (Public Act 096-0054, Section 35(h}))

SECTION Il. PENALTIES.

a  Ineach seclion of the Internalional Building Code - 2012 Edilion in which a fine or viclalion thereof is specified.
the same is nereby superseded by the penalty provisions hereinalter set forth. which penalty provisions are
hereby substiluted so as to cover any and all violations of this Qrdinance or of any provisicns of said

Internalional Building Code —~ 2012 Edition adopled there under.

b Any person who shall violale any provision herecf or any provisicns of the Intemational Building Code — 2012
Edilion hereby adopted or shall fail to comply therewith. or who shall violate or fail to comply with any order made
there under. or who shall build in violation of any detailed slatement of specificalions or plans submilted and
approved there under, or any certificate or permit issued there under. and from which no appeal has been laken.
or who shall fail lo comply with such an order as may be afflirmed or modified on appeal or by court of competent
jurisdiction. within the time duly fixed for compliance, shall severally for each and svery such violalion and
noncompliance respectively. be guilly of @ misdemeancr. punishable by a fing of nol more than $750.00° and
when not olherwise specified. each day during which any prehibiled condition continues shall conslitule 2

separale offense.

¢ The applicalion of the above penally shall nol be held to prevent the enforced remaoval of prohibiled conditions




SECTION !ll. REPEAL Al parts of ordinances in conflict herewith. but only lo extent of such conflict. are hereby repealed

SECTION IV. SAVING CLAUSE Nothing in this Ordinance or in those parts of the Basic Code hereby adopled shall be
conslrued to affect any suil or proceecing pending in any courl, or any rights acquired, or liabilily ncurred, or any cause or
causes of aclion acquired or existing under any ordinance provision repealed by Section 3 above nor shall any just or legal
night or remedy of any character be lost impaired. or affectad by this ordinance

SECTION V. SEVERANCE CLAUSE. If any provision. clause. senlence. paragraph. section or part of this ordinance. or the
applicalion thereof lo any persen firm. corporation. or circumstance. shall. for any reason. be adjudged by a court or competent
Jurisdiction to be unconstitulional or invald, said judgment shall nol affect. imparr or nvalidate the remainder of this ordinance or
lhe application of such provisions to other persons. firms. corporalions or circumstances involved It 1s hereby declared to be
the legislative intent of the Corporate Authorities that this ordinance would have been adopled had such invalid provisions not
been included or 1f it had not been made applicable lo such persan. firm corporalion or circumslance

SECTION VI. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and afler its passage. approval and publication as required by
law.

SECTION VII. This ordinance shall be known &s the “Gurnee Bullding Code

SECTION VIII. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval and publicalion in
pariphlel form as required by law



Passed and approved this 16! day of April, 2012.

Ayes: Nays: Absent/Abstain:
Jeanne E Balmes %
Greg Garner x
Kirk Morris 2
Stephen Park P
Cheryl G. Ross %
Hank Schwarz X
APPROVED:
/
/ oo

P -

fek,

\"\

. = \1"- N . F ' )
o il k A F L el i Date i - 5(’ .

;j

es)
g
=

] B ! i
/" KRISTINA KOVARIK, President

e

ATTEST:

By: '
ANDY HARRIS, Village Clerk

Presented and read, or reading having been waived, at a duly convened meeting of the Corporate
Authorities on April 16, 2012.

| hereby certify that the above ordinance was published in pamphlet form on April 17, 2012, as provided by
law.

oty -~
. e .
e, el
o Yo 78 i
Voo ~ e
s W,

B iy ;
A ANDY HARRIS, Village Clerk




STATE OF ILLINOIS )

COUNTY OF LAKE )

CERTIFICATE

. ANDY HARRIS, certify that | am the duly elected and acting Municipal Clerk of the

Village of Gurnee, Lake County, lllinois.

| cerlify that on April 16, 2012, the Corporate Authorities of such municipality passed and
approved Ordinance No. 2012-"5¢ | entifled “AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2012
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, AS MODIFIED AND WITH
SUPPLEMENTS. PROVIDING PENALITIES FOR VIOLATIONS AND AMENDING CHAPTER
18 ARTICLE 111 OF THE GURNEE MUNICIPAL CODE," which provided by its terms that it

should be published in pamphlet form.

The pamphlet form of Ordinance No. 2012 - S5u including the Ordinance and a
cover sheet thereof, was prepared, and a copy of such Ordinance was posted in the municipal
building. commencing on April 17, 2012, and continuing for at least ten days thereafter. Copies of

such Ordinance were also available for public inspection upon request in the office of the municipal

clerk.

Dated at Gurnee, lllinois, this 16" day of April, 2012.

)

. i
NV Ay
b ‘.". s
" ANDY HARRIS, Village Clerk
Village of Gurnee

s




